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14th July 2023 

 

 

 

TO WHOMSOEVER IT MAY CONCERN 
 
 

 
This is to certify that Mr. Pala Sai Teja, has successfully completed the internship in the field 

of Technical Trainee - Intern from 10-April-2023 to 01-June -2023 (2 Months) under the guidance of 

Boyapati Swadeep Kumar, Job Controller. During the period of her internship program with us,

Pala Sai Teja has been exposed to different processes and was found punctual, hardworking and 
inquisitive. 
 

We wish Pala Sai Teja every success in his life and career and all the very best for his future endeavors. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

For Raam4Wheelers LLP 

 
 
 
 
 

 
Prashanth Chintalapudi 

Manager - HR Operations 

  



 
      
 

14th July 2023 
 

TO WHOMSOEVER IT MAY CONCERN 
 
 

 
This is to certify that Mr. Nerella SravanKumar , has successfully completed the internship in the field 

of Technical Trainee - Intern from 10-April-2023 to 01-June -2023 (2 Months) under the guidance of 

Boyapati Swadeep Kumar, Job Controller. During the period of her internship program with us, 

Nerella SravanKumar has been exposed to different processes and was found punctual, hardworking 

 and inquisitive. 
 

We wish Nerella SravanKumar every success in his life and career and all the very best for his future 

endeavors. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

For Raam4Wheelers LLP 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Prashanth Chintalapudi 

Manager - HR Operations 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 
 

14th July 2023 

 

 

TO WHOMSOEVER IT MAY CONCERN 
 
 

 
This is to certify that Mr. Pedduri Chathuranan , has successfully completed the internship in the field 

of Technical Trainee - Intern from 10-April-2023 to 01-June -2023 (2 Months) under the guidance of 

Boyapati Swadeep Kumar, Job Controller. During the period of her internship program with us, 

Pedduri Chathuranan has been exposed to different processes and was found punctual, hardworking 

and inquisitive. 
 

We wish Pedduri Chathuranan every success in his life and career and all the very best for his future 

Endeavors. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

For Raam4Wheelers LLP 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Prashanth Chintalapudi 

Manager - HR Operations 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 
14th July 2023 

 

 

 

TO WHOMSOEVER IT MAY CONCERN 
 
 

 

This is to certify that Mr. PINNINTI BHARATH KUMAR , has successfully completed the internship in the 
field of Technical Trainee - Intern from 10-April-2023 to 01-June -2023 (2 Months) under the guidance 
of Boyapati Swadeep Kumar, Job Controller. During the period of her internship program with us,

PINNINTI BHARATH KUMAR has been exposed to different processes and was found punctual, 
hardworking and inquisitive. 

We wish PINNINTI BHARATH KUMAR every success in his life and career and all the very best for his 
future endeavors. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

For Raam4Wheelers LLP 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Prashanth Chintalapudi 

Manager - HR Operations 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

14th July 2023 

 

 

 

TO WHOMSOEVER IT MAY CONCERN 
 
 

 

This is to certify that Ms. Ponugoti Navya Sri , has successfully completed the internship in the field of 
Technical Trainee - Intern from 10-April-2023 to 01-June -2023 (2 Months) under the guidance of 
Boyapati Swadeep Kumar, Job Controller. During the period of her internship program with us,

Ponugoti Navya Sri has been exposed to different processes and was found punctual, hardworking and 
inquisitive. 

We wish Ponugoti Navya Sri every success in his life and career and all the very best for his future 
endeavors. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

For Raam4Wheelers LLP 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Prashanth Chintalapudi 

Manager - HR Operations 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

14th July 2023 

 

 

 

TO WHOMSOEVER IT MAY CONCERN 
 
 

 

This is to certify that Mr. Poosala Shiva Kumar , has successfully completed the internship in the field of 
Technical Trainee - Intern from 10-April-2023 to 01-June -2023 (2 Months) under the guidance of 
Boyapati Swadeep Kumar, Job Controller. During the period of her internship program with us,

Poosala Shiva Kumar has been exposed to different processes and was found punctual, hardworking and 
inquisitive. 

We wish Poosala Shiva Kumar every success in his life and career and all the very best for his future 
endeavors. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

For Raam4Wheelers LLP 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Prashanth Chintalapudi 

Manager - HR Operations 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

14th July 2023 

 

 

 

TO WHOMSOEVER IT MAY CONCERN 
 
 

 

This is to certify that Mr. Varamani Praveen Sai , has successfully completed the internship in the field of 
Technical Trainee - Intern from 10-April-2023 to 01-June -2023 (2 Months) under the guidance of 
Boyapati Swadeep Kumar, Job Controller. During the period of her internship program with us,

Varamani Praveen Sai has been exposed to different processes and was found punctual, hardworking 
and inquisitive. 

We wish Varamani Praveen Sai every success in his life and career and all the very best for his future 
endeavors. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

For Raam4Wheelers LLP 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Prashanth Chintalapudi 

Manager - HR Operations 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 
14th July 2023 

 

 

 

TO WHOMSOEVER IT MAY CONCERN 
 
 

 

This is to certify that Mr. Janagani Yamuna , has successfully completed the internship in the field of 
Technical Trainee - Intern from 10-April-2023 to 01-June -2023 (2 Months) under the guidance of 
Boyapati Swadeep Kumar, Job Controller. During the period of her internship program with us,

Janagani Yamuna has been exposed to different processes and was found punctual, hardworking and 
inquisitive. 

We wish Janagani Yamuna every success in his life and career and all the very best for his future 
endeavors. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

For Raam4Wheelers LLP 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Prashanth Chintalapudi 

Manager - HR Operations 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 
14th July 2023 

 

 

 

TO WHOMSOEVER IT MAY CONCERN 
 
 

 

This is to certify that Mr. Eppakayala Sai Kamal, has successfully completed the internship in the field of 
Technical Trainee - Intern from 10-April-2023 to 01-June -2023 (2 Months) under the guidance of 
Boyapati Swadeep Kumar, Job Controller. During the period of her internship program with us,

Eppakayala Sai Kamal has been exposed to different processes and was found punctual, hardworking 
and inquisitive. 

We wish Eppakayala Sai Kamal every success in his life and career and all the very best for his future 
endeavors. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

For Raam4Wheelers LLP 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Prashanth Chintalapudi 

Manager - HR Operations 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


	3.7.1.pdf (p.1-54)
	3.7.1 13213.pdf (p.55-63)

